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Albany County Airport Authority

Airport and FBO Operating Expenses
YTD Budget vs. Actual High/Low by Category Report

For the 4 month period ending April 30/31, 2024

| Budget @ Actual Variance
Airport Operating Expenses
Material & Supplies
38 54060 Mower Repair & Maintenance 5,667 1,317 4,350
38 52071 ID Tags 12,333 7,491 4,842
38 54030 General Equipment Repair & Maintt 52,605 46,972 5,633
38 54040 Heavy Equipment Maintenance 26,667 20,385 6,282
38 54010 Gasoline 41,667 35,279 6,388
38 52034 Roof 8,333 1,219 7,114
38 54013 Vehicle/Equipment Tires 27,333 19,410 7,923
38 54021 Vehicle Repair & Maintenance 42,667 31,926 10,740
38 51011 Airfield Lighting 36,667 22,119 14,547
38 51031 ARFF Supplies 29,398 11,035 18,363
38 52062 Janitorial Supplies 73,707 52,489 21,218
38 51053 Electric 66,667 45,321 21,345
38 53050 Snow Removal Services 126,000 101,278 24,722
38 52090 Flight Information Displays 11,367 (14,630) 25,997
38 53030 Pavement Repairs 30,000 2,096 27,904
38 52032 Elevator Repairs & Supplies 38,333 9,691 28,642
38 51020 Rubber Removal 30,000 30,000
38 52033 HVAC 53,500 21,859 31,641
38 52012 Card Access System 33,333 533 32,800
38 53010 Landscaping 67,833 14,301 53,532
38 52060 Building Maintenance 225,667 149,104 76,563
38 51019 Snow Removal Supplies 123,333 13,328 110,005
1,934,842 1,716,587 218,255
Office/Administration
39 66060 CreditCard Service Charges 229,333 283,327 (53,993)
39 55015 Hardware/Software Maint Support 200,303 224,905 (24,602)
39 66062 Bank & Paying Agent Fees 4,000 11,955 (7,955)
39 66012 Authority Management Travel & Edi 9,533 16,389 (6,855)
39 66050 Property Taxes 12,667 15,054 (2,387)
39 55012 Office Equipment Service Agreemel 3,233 4,556 (1,323)
39 55050 Reference Materials 567 849 (282)
39 55010 Office Equipment Rental 5,159 4,996 164
39 66011 Authority Board Travel & Education 167 167
39 66002 AAAE 217 217
39 55040 Postage 3,000 2,649 351
39 55030 Printed Forms / Letterhead 933 539 394
39 55041 Express Mail 667 190 476
39 55011 Copy Machine Use 567 567
39 66014 Outside Functions 667 667
39 66020 Tuition Reimbursement 833 833
39 66040 Licenses & Permits 1,283 110 1,173
39 55060 Office Supplies 10,922 8,765 2,156
39 66010 Training/ Travel 53,367 50,795 2,572
39 66000 Dues & Subscriptions 18,552 15,803 2,749
39 55032 Printing Outside Services 6,667 3,569 3,098
39 55070 Payroll Services 14,167 10,966 3,201
39 66013 Function Refreshments 5,000 1,226 3,774
39 55031 Parking Ticket Stock 4,667 4,667
39 55014 Computer Systems 21,433 16,758 4,675
39 66030 Advertising - Public Meetings 10,000 1,480 8,520
39 55020 Office Furniture & Fixtures 17,717 4,811 12,906
39 66061 EZPass Fees 55,000 42,017 12,983
39 55016 Computer Equipment 74,463 49,358 25,105
765,081 771,067 (5,985)
Non-Capital Equipment
41 83000 Equipment 305,217 138,108 167,109
305,217 138,108 167,109
13,232,434 12,521,731 710,703

Totals may not reconcile with finencial s_tatenmf due to revenue sharing and other adjustrrents.



Albany County Airport Authority
Airport and FBO Operating Expenses
YTD Budget vs. Actual High/Low by Category Report

For the 4 month period ending April 30/31, 2024

‘ ! Budget  Actual Variance
FBO Operating Expenses
Cost of Good Sold (FBO)
32 51111 Deicing Type | - Constortium 146,850 382,143 (235,293)
32 51113 Deicing Type IV - Consortium 39,450 122,553 (83,103)
32 51110 Deicing Type | - Sprayed 176,873 222,767 (45,894)
32 51107 Fuel Costs - Diesel 50,000 69,124 (19,124)
32 51112 Deicing Type IV - Sprayed 14,597 22,723 (8,127)
32 51105 Fuel Costs - Auto Gas 24,000 26,175 (2,175)
32 51125 OQil 333 1,721 (1,388)
32 51108 Fuel Costs-AvGas Commercial 5,000 4,699 301
32 51126 TKS 333 0 333
32 51103 Fuel Costs - AvGas 106,950 87,137 19,813
32 51102 Jet A Discounts 100,000 62,358 37,642
32 51101 Fuel Costs - Jet A 1,246,667 963,236 283,431
1,911,053 1,964,635 (53,582)
Salaries Expense
34 11000 Salaries 602,841 648,503 (45,662)
34 12010 Overtime 1.5 82,675 87,611 (4,936)
685,516 736,114 (50,598)
Other Employee Expenses
35 21000 Social Security 45,089 55,299 (10,209)
35 25005 Uniform Purchases 8,030 13,434 (5,404)
35 29001 Retirement 5,133 8,733 (3,600)
35 24000 Medical Exams 500 500
35 22200 Dental Insurance 658 658
35 26020 Unemployment Insurance 9,589 8,826 763
35 26010 NYS Disability 1,406 1,406
35 25000 Uniforms & Laundry 5,217 1,233 3,984
35 22000 Health 192,644 132,017 60,627
268,267 219,543 48,724
Utilities
36 33000 Natural Gas 8,933 19,724 (10,791)
36 36035 Radio Communications 150 443 (293)
36 36033 Wireless 952 1,100 (148)
36 36030 Telephone - Cellular 0 0
36 36010 Telephone Charges-Local 58 58
36 36011 Telephone Charges-Long Distance 65 65
36 35000 Water 667 467 200
36 36060 Cable Television 2,203 1,361 842
36 31000 Electric 21,000 17,280 3,720
34,029 40,376 (6,347)
Purchased Services
37 45000 Janitorial Services 20,384 35,497 (15,114)
37 42095 Insurance Claims 1,667 3,000 (1,333)
37 42041 Environmental Liability 15,811 16,307 (496)
37 45010 Refuse Removal Services 883 1,035 (151)
37 46010 Public Relations 14,000 10,500 3,500
37 42060 Property Insurance 21,000 9,357 11,643
37 49040 Professional Management 96,300 84,027 12,273
37 42010 Airport Liability 60,228 60,228
230,273 159,724 70,549
Material & Supplies
38 54075 Fuel Truck Lease 42,592 124,445 (81,853)
38 52063 Window Washing 689 6,826 (6,137)
38 54030 General Equipment Repair/Maint 26,805 29,972 (3,167)
38 54011 Diesel Fuel 23,333 25,834 (2,500)
38 54070 Vehicle Shop Tools & Supplies 1,000 3,366 (2,366)
38 52031 Electrical Repairs & Supplies 3,900 5,269 (1,369)
38 54021 Vehicle Repair & Maintenance 1,167 2,024 (857)
38 54013 Vehicle/Equipment Tires 7,000 7,480 (480)
38 52037 Pest Control 267 256 1
38 54022 Vehicle Communications Equipmen 333 333
38 52036 Automatic Door Repairs & Supplies 667 667
38 52032 Elevator Repairs & Supplies 1,167 404 763
38 52010 Alarm & PA Systems 2,500 1,400 1,100
38 54031 Quality Control Equipment 2,333 1,229 1,104

Totals may not reconcile with financial staterent due to revenue sharing and other adjustments.



Albany County Airport Authority

Airport and FBO Operating Expenses
YTD Budget vs. Actual High/Low by Category Report

For the 4 month period ending April 30/31, 2024

Budget ' Actual Variance
FBO Operating Expenses
Material & Supplies
38 52060 Building Maintenance 14,280 13,168 1112
38 52034 Roof 1,167 1,167
38 54010 Gasoline 4,000 2,619 1,381
38 52035 Plumbing Repairs & Supplies 1,833 316 1,517
38 52033 HVAC 9,000 5,571 3,429
38 52062 Janitorial Supplies 9,000 3,126 5,874
38 53078 Liquid Waste Disposal 12,667 4,540 8,126
38 54040 Heavy Equipment Maintenance 43,833 27,395 16,438
209,532 265,239 (55,707)
Office/Administration
39 66000 Dues & Subscriptions 6,067 18,960 (12,894)
39 66015 Incentives 13,333 16,979 (3,646)
39 55015 Hardware/Software Maint Agreemet 4,428 6,525 (2,097)
39 66060 CreditCard Service Charges 75,000 76,146 (1,146)
39 55014 Computer Systems 917 1,269 (352)
39 55012 Office Equipment Service Agreemel 167 508 (341)
39 55030 Printed Forms/Letterhead 67 393 (326)
39 55010 Office Equipment Rental 467 727 (260)
39 55032 Printing Outside Services 0 0
39 55070 Payroll Services 6,333 5,806 527
39 55016 Computer Equipment 533 533
39 66010 Training/Travel 3,167 3,167
39 55060 Office Supplies 5,000 1,594 3,406
115,478 128,908 (13,430)
Non-Capital Equipment
41 83000 Equipment 38,168 40,676 (2,508)
38,168 40,676 (2,508)
3,492,317 3,555,215 (62,898)

Totals may not reconcile with financial staterent due to revenue sharing and other adjustnents.



Albany County Airport Authority

Airport and FBO Operating Expenses
YTD Budget vs. Actual High/Low by Category Report

For the 4 month period ending April 30/31, 2024

Budget Actual Variance
$16,724,751 $16,076,946 $ 647,805

Totals ey not reconcile with financial staterent due to revenue sharing and other adjustrents.
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Plastic Express, | Central Poly Bag | C&C Janitorial | WB Mason Co., United Sales USA Imperial Bag & Hill-n-Markes,
Company Name Inc. Corp Supplies, Inc. Inc. Aramsco, Inc. Sanico, Inc. Priority Cleans Corp Unipak Corp Paper Co. LLC Inc.
Item #10: Can Liners (24x33)
Cost per Case $19.40 §16.70 $27.16 $30.27 $39.32 $16.88 $86.93 $12.54 $16.25 20,95 $34.15
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
L_rand Bid Plastic Prince Central Poly CCi Heritage Pro-Link Berry Plastics Other SKC uPcC Victoria Bay Individual
Packaging 1000 1000/case 1000/case 1000/carton 1000/case I Standard 50/roll-20/case 1000/case 1000/case 20/50/case
Delivery ARO 5-14 Days 10-14 Days 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri. 7 Days 1-7 Days 1-10 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 3-5 Days 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 48 Hrs. 24-36 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes
Item #11: Can Liners (33x40, .62mil)
Cost per Case $16.80 $14.93 $22.00 $21.59 $32.71 $15.45 $83.66 $13.92 $15.60 $15.50 $25.80
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Brand Bid Plastic Prince Central Poly ccl Heritage Pro-Link Aluf Plastics Other SKC upPC Victoria Bay Individual
P ging 250 250/case 250icarton 250/case 250/case Standard 250 250 250/ca: 250/case, 16mic
Delivery ARO 5-14 Days 10-14 Days 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri. 7 Days 1-7 Days 1-10 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 3-5 Days 48 Hrs, 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 24-36 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes
Item #12: Can Linars (43x48)
Cost per Case $29.25 $16.99 $30.59 $26.99 §38.49 $21.98 92.68 NO BID $19.50 21.75 $33.28
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Brand Bid Plastic Prince Central Poly CClI Heritage Pro-Link Aluf Plastics Other uPC Victoria Bay Heritage
F ging 200 200/case 200/case 250icarton 250/case 200/case Standard 200 200icase 200/case
Delivery ARO 5-14 Days 10-14 Days 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri. 7 Days 1-10 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 3-5 Days 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes




Plastic Express, | Central Poly Bag | C&C Janitorial | WB Mason Co., United Sales USA Imperial Bag & Hill-n-Markes,
Company Name Inc. Corp Supplies, Inc. Inc. Aramsco, Inc, Sanico, Inc. Priority Cleans Corp Unipak Corp Paper Co. LLC Inc.
Item #13: Bleach
Cost per Case $25.25 NO BID $17.78 $24.73 $21.30 NO BID $130.97 NO BID NO BID $17.50 524.49
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yeos Yes Yes
I;ma Pure Bright Diamond Chemical Pure Bright Pure Bright Other KIK I-NTL Hill n Markes
Packaging “6/1galicase 4 galicase 1 gali6 per carton 61 galicase Standard 6/1gal 6/1 galicase
Delivery ARO 2-5 Days 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days 7 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes
Item #14: Laundry Detergent
Cost per Case NO BID NO BID $91.66 NO BID $104.77 NO BID $124.80 NO BID NO BID $63.00 $29.62
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
I;rand Bid Spartan Spartan Other Victoria Bay Simoniz
Packaging 5 gal pail 5 gal pail Standard 5 gal 5 gal pail
Delivery ARQ 3 Days 14 Days. 7 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 2 Days 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes
Item #15: Floor Wax/Finish
Cost per Case $82.45 NO BID §116.00 $64.92 $96.86 $157.20 $241.74 NO BID NO BID $72.00 62.09
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Brand Bid Betco Spartan NCL Spartan Buckeye Other Victoria Bay Simoniz
Packaging 5 gal & gal pail 5 gal & gal pail 5 gal Premium 5gal 5 gal pail
Delivery ARO 7-14 Days 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri. 7 Days 2-1 Days 7-10 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 48 Hrs. 2 Days NO



















Plastic Express, | Central Poly Bag | C&C Janitorial | WB Mason Co., United Sales USA Imperial Bag & Hill-n-Markes,
Company Name Inc. Corp Supplies, Inc. Inc. Aramsco, Inc. Sanico, Inc. Priority Cleans Corp Unipak Corp Paper Co. LLC Inc.
Item #31: Powder Free Exam Gloves (Vinyl)
Cost per Case $33.99 NO BID $44.10 $2.10 ea. $18.00 $22.45 $82.78 $17.88 $27.40 $17.50 $29.99
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Y b 4 Yes Yes
Brand Bid Emerald Emerald WB Mason Safety Zone Elara Other Crystal Ware Emerald Victoria Bay Food Handler
|Packaging 100/box-10/case 10/1100ct/case 100/box 10/100/box 10 boxes/100/case Basic 1000 10/100 *10/100/case 10/100/case
Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri. 7 Days 1-7 Days 1-10 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 48 Hrs. 24-36 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes
Item #32: Alkaling (D-cell)
Cost per Case NO BID NO BID §130.24 $1.77 $18.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID *$16.99 $121.50
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Y
Brand Bid Rayovac Duracall Pro-CelliDuracell Duracell Pro Cell
Packagin 12/6ct/case 12 pack 12/box 12/case 6/box-12/case
Delivery ARO 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days _2Days Yes
Item #33: Green Hand Pad (Scrub pad)
Cost per Case §21.99 NO BID §36.30 $5.24 §19.70 $12.60 $77.40 §28.94 NO BID “4.95 §22.96
Meel or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes i Yes Yes
Brand Bid Boardwalk M Boardwalk ACS Scrubble ACS Industries Other Amercare Royal Victoria Bay Disco
Packaging 60 60/case 20/carton 60/case 60/case Basic 10/box-6/carton 20/case 6/box-10icase
Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri. 7 Days 1-7 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 48 Hrs. 24-36 Hrs. 2 Days Yes







Plastic Express, | Central Poly Bag | C&C Janitorial | WB Mason Co., United Sales USA Imperial Bag & Hill-n-Markes,
Company Name Inc., Corp Supplies, Inc. Inc. Aramsco, Inc. Sanico, Inc. Priority Cleans Corp Unipak Corp Paper Co. LLC Inc,
|ltem #37M: Roll Towel
Cost per Case $563.99 $28.00 £42.61 $26.10 $36.48 $29.88 $B6.88 NO BID NO BID $22.75 $61.55
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Brand Bid Georgia Pacific Marcal SCA/Tork Marcal Essity/Tork Nittany Other Victoria Bay Kimberly Clark
Packaging 12/350'case 12/1360case * 6 rolls/B00"case 12 rolls/350'case *12/350'case 12/350'case Standard 12/350'/case 6/950%case
Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 10-14 Days 3 Days 1-1 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri, 7 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 3-5 Days 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 48 Hrs, 2 Days Yes
Item #38M: and Marble Cls
Cost per Case NO BID NO BID $48.92 NO BID $53.04 NO BID $85.32 NO BID NO BID 89.85 $78.00
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Y
Brand Bid Spartan Weiman Other Miracle Seal Betco
Packaging 12/200zicase 6/24oz/case "6/18oz./case 4/1 gal 12/320z/case
Delivery ARO 3 Days 14 Days 7 Days 2-3 Days 7-10 Days
‘Ememenc! Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 2 Days 48 Hrs. 2 Days No
Bid Bond $2,000 Check Yes NiA Yes Yes $2,000 Check $2,000 Check $2,000 Check $2,000 Check $2,000 Check
Offerer Disclosure X X X X X X X X X X X
Non Colsn. X X X X X X X X X X X
References X X X X X X X X X X X
A ledgment X X X X X X X X X X X
Notes:

50% off list on 0% off list on 32% off list on 15% off list on 50% off liston 0% off list on 39% off list on 21% off list on Minimum of 30% off | At least 10% off list on

additional items

additional items

additional items

additional items

items

additional items

additional items

additional items

list on | items

| items

* Clanfications requested via email

I, Bobbi Matthews, certify that this bid tabulation is a true copy of the prices submitted by each bidder for the commmaodities shown above

a":\inany Airport Authority Purc! sy\g_Depanmenl
y Lz 4 T~
Ol | Heios

Do

=" Bobbi Mattheys
Purchasing Adent

Sworn to before me this day of

20

Notary Public



Plastic Express, | Central Poly Bag | C&C Janitorial | WB Mason Co., United Sales USA Imperial Bag & Hill-n-Markes,
Company Name Inc. Corp Supplies, Inc. Inc. Aramsco, Inc. Sanico, Inc. Priority Cleans Corp Unipak Corp Paper Co. LLC Inc.
Item #37M: Roll Towel
Cost per Case $53.99 528.00 $42.61 §26.10 $36.48 $29.88 $86.88 NO BID NO BID 522.75 $61.55
Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yeos Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Brand Bid Georgia Pacific Marcal SCA/Tork Marcal Essity/Tork Nittany Other Victoria Bay Kimberly Clark
Packagi *12/350'/case 12/350'/caso * & rolls/B00/case *12 rolls/a50'Icase *12/350'/case 121350'Icase Standard 12/350"/case 6/350"case
Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 10-14 Days I 3 Days 1-3 Days 14 Days Wed. or Fri. 7 Days _ 2-3 Days 3-5 Days
|Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 3-5 Days 48 Hrs. 48 Hrs. 2 Days Yes 48 Hrs. Yes
Item #38M: Granite and Marble Cleaner
Cos! per Case NO BID NQ BID $48.92 NO BID $53.04 NO BID $85.32 NO BID NC BID 89.85 $78.00
|Meet or Exceed Specs Yes Yes Yes Yes Y
Brand 3id Spartan Weiman Other Miracle Seal Belco
Packaging 12/200z/case 6/24oz/case “6/18oz./case 4I1 gal 12/320z/case
Delivery ARO 3 Days 14 Days 7 Days 2-3 Days 7-10 Days
|Emergency Delivery ARO 48 Hrs. 2 Days 48 Hrs. 2 Days No
Bid Bond §2.000 Check Yes N/A Yes Yes $2,000 Check $2,000 Check 52,000 Check 52,000 Check 52,000 Check
Offerer Disclosure X X X X X X X X X X X
Non Colsn. X X X X X X X X X X X
Relerences X X X X X X X X X X X
Acknowledgment X X X X X X X X X X X
Notes:
50% off list on 0% off list on 32% off list on 15% off list on 50% olf list on 0% off list on 19% off list on 21% off list on Minimum of 30% off | At least 10% off list on
additional items additional items additional items additional items additional items additional items additional items additional items list on addilional items additional items

* Clanlicalions requested via email

I, Bobbi Matthews, certity that this brd labulabion 15 @ true copy of the prices submitted by each bidder for the wmmmncl:ues shown abova

N!mny Airpon Aul.hanty Fur:?s}ng Ocpmmcm

ﬂﬁyfw\/

"= Babbi Matthews
Purchasing Agent

\_\.\

U~ g4~
Vi

f)é day ol March zog({

-q}fj/l: before me this

Nnmly Putﬂrl:

JENNIFER
Notaiy \Juu\;.

N
Qualified in Schonect
Commissi

A. MUNGE
State of
01 mU's 246332
ady County

1on Expires Aug, 08, 20¢ J































































































































































































































































































































































































































AGENDA ITEM NO. 12

Authorization of Federal and State Grants



AGENDA ITEM NO. 13

Informational Only






New Business



Executive Session

Attorney-Client Privilege Matters
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